
Contributors at the $10,000, $5000 and
$1000 levels will be listed on a bronze
plaque at the new rifle range.
Contributors at the $250 level will be
displayed on a wooden plaque at the
range. All contributors of $50 or more
will receive a special recognition pin. A
listing of all contributors will be given to
the Meyerings.

An individual gift may be recognized
both separately and as up to 20% of a
group’s total at a higher level. For
example, a troop with three $250 gifts
and four $100 gifts from members
would also be listed as a $1000 group
donor.  If you are donating as part of a
group, please list the group here:

    ___________________________

Contributions to the Otetiana Council,
Inc. are tax-deductible to the full extent
allowed by law.

If paying by credit card (Visa or
MasterCard only, please):

Card Type:   ___ Visa
___ Mastercard

Card #_________________________

Expiration _____/_____

Signature ______________________

Date Signed ____________
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Sketch Floor Plan of Rifle Range
    (main slab dimensions 20’x80’)

Budgeted costs:
Engineering & Design $  4,400
Site work incl. 16’ berm $29,700
Foundation & concrete pad $28,800
Utilities $  5,500
Building materials $18,600
   (carpentry by volunteers)
Additional Rifles $  2,000
Contingency $  1,000

Total $90,000
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Camp Background: The Otetiana
Council, Boy Scouts of America,
operates the Massawepie Scout
Camps near Tupper Lake in the
Adirondack Mountains of New York
State to serve Boy Scouts from
Rochester and Monroe County. In
2000, after a successful capital
campaign, Camp Pioneer at
Massawepie was extensively
refurbished and reopened. Camp
Pioneer now serves over 2100 Boy
Scouts each summer.

Need for a new Rifle Range: A rifle
range for teaching firearm safety is a
standard part of the Boy Scout summer
camp program. When Camp Pioneer
was reopened in 2000, budget
constraints prevented the construction
of a rifle range. Since then, Scouts
have been walking or getting rides to
an old rifle range in the former Camp
Mountaineer. The small size of this
range, and its distance from camp, has
prevented many Scouts from using the
camp’s safe shooting program.

The plan: A new rifle range will be
constructed at the edge of Camp
Pioneer. The new range will have 16
firing points, twice the capacity of the
Mountaineer range. Construction will
begin in 2003. The range is expected
to be fully operational for the 2004
season, assuming adequate funds are
raised for construction.

Naming: The new Camp Pioneer rifle
range will be named for Ray and Addy
Meyering, who are long-time
Massawepie staff members.
    Ray Meyering worked at the former
Warren Cutler summer camp in
Webster before Massawepie was
purchased, and then worked on the
1952 Massawepie staff before
becoming a New York State trooper.
After retiring from the State Police, he
became the Camp Forester rifle range
director in 1980.
    Ray has directed Massawepie rifle
ranges each summer since then, at
Camp Forester through 1994, then at
Camp Mountaineer until the reopening
of Camp Pioneer in 2000.
    Addy has worked at Massawepie
with her husband most summers since
1980, first in the Trading Post or
Handicraft area and most recently
assisting at the rifle range.
    Ray and Addy have been associated
for years with Troop 111 in Brockport.

How can I help? Donations are
needed to cover the budgeted
construction costs of $90,000. Your gift
is important to make this project
happen for future Camp Pioneer
Scouts, and to recognize the
Meyerings for their many years of
service to Massawepie. Gifts from
individuals, Scout troops, businesses,
and sporting clubs will all be needed to
make this new rifle range a reality.

Pledge of Support for the Ray and
Addy Meyering Rifle Range at
Massawepie’s Camp Pioneer

Name _________________________

Address _______________________

City, State  _____________________

Zip ________ Phone _____________

Yes, I’ll help build the new range with
my gift as follows:

$_______ Check Enclosed
       (payable to Otetiana Council, BSA)

$_______ Credit Card
     (please complete reverse side)

$________  Bill me __ times in 2003
     (minimum $25 per payment, please)

$________  Bill me __ times in 2004
     (minimum $25 per payment, please)
------------------

$ _________ Total pledge
(Acct. #2-4511-702-90)

 (See reverse side for more information
including recognition levels)

Return to: Otetiana Council, Inc.
Boy Scouts of America
474 East Avenue
Rochester, NY 14607
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